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Introduction 
Mood swings are a common occurrence in everyone's life, 
characterized by drastic changes in emotion or mood. In the 
case of females, these mood swings can sometimes be more 
intense and frequent due to various factors like hormonal 
changes, stress, and lifestyle. Understanding the causes, 
symptoms, and treatment options for female mood swings is 
crucial for managing this condition effectively. Female mood 
swings are a common occurrence that many women 
experience due to various factors influencing their physical 
and emotional well-being. 

 



 

In this essay, we will delve into the causes, symptoms, and 
treatment of female mood swings from the perspective of 
Unani medicine, a traditional system of healing that 
emphasizes the balance of humors and holistic approaches to 
health. 

Causes of Female Mood Swings 
One prominent cause of female mood swings is hormonal 
changes. Fluctuations in estrogen and progesterone levels 
during the menstrual cycle, pregnancy, or menopause can 
significantly impact mood regulation. These hormonal shifts 
can lead to irritability, anxiety, or feelings of sadness in 
women. 
Additionally, stress and anxiety play a vital role in triggering 
mood swings in females. The demands of work, family, or 
other responsibilities can create overwhelming situations, 
causing emotional instability. Chronic stress can also affect 
hormonal balance, exacerbating mood swings. 
Lifestyle factors such as poor diet, lack of exercise, 
inadequate sleep, and substance abuse can further 
contribute to female mood swings. Imbalances in 
neurotransmitters like serotonin, which is affected by 
lifestyle choices, can influence mood regulation and 
emotional stability. 
 
 
 

 



 

Mood swings in women are often attributed to hormonal 

fluctuations, particularly changes in estrogen and 

progesterone levels during the menstrual cycle, pregnancy, 

or menopause. These hormonal shifts can have a significant 

impact on neurotransmitters in the brain, leading to changes 

in mood and emotional responses. Additionally, psychological 

factors such as stress, anxiety, and depression can also 

contribute to mood swings, as well as external factors like 

lifestyle choices, environmental stressors, and relationship 

dynamics. Unani medicine recognizes the importance of 

these factors and emphasizes the need to address the root 

cause of mood swings to achieve long-term relief. 

Symptoms of Female Mood Swings 
The symptoms of female mood swings can vary from person 
to person, but common manifestations include emotional, 
physical, and behavioral changes. Emotionally, women may 
experience intense feelings of sadness, irritability, anger, or 
moodiness without a clear cause. Physical symptoms like 
fatigue, headaches, and muscle tension can accompany these 
emotional shifts. Behavioral symptoms might include social 
withdrawal, difficulty concentrating, or increased sensitivity 
to stimuli.  

 

 



 

The symptoms of female mood swings can manifest in 
various ways, including emotional symptoms like irritability, 
sadness, and anxiety, physical symptoms such as fatigue, 
headaches, and changes in appetite, cognitive symptoms like 
difficulty in concentration and memory issues, and social 
symptoms including withdrawal from relationships and 
irritability towards others. Unani medicine approaches these 
symptoms by understanding them as imbalances in the 
humors of the body, particularly the four humors of blood, 
phlegm, yellow bile, and black bile. By identifying the humor 
that is out of balance, Unani practitioners can prescribe 
specific dietary recommendations, herbal remedies, lifestyle 
modifications, rejuvenation therapies, and psychological 
interventions to restore harmony and alleviate mood swings. 

Treatment of Female Mood Swings 
Addressing female mood swings involves a multi-faceted 
approach that incorporates lifestyle modifications, therapy, 
and medication when necessary. Adopting a healthy lifestyle, 
including regular exercise, balanced nutrition, and sufficient 
rest, can help stabilize mood by supporting overall mental 
and physical well-being. 
Therapy and counseling provide valuable tools for women to 
explore and address the underlying causes of their mood 
swings. Techniques such as cognitive-behavioral therapy 
(CBT) can help individuals develop coping strategies, manage 
stress more effectively, and improve emotional regulation.



  
In some cases where mood swings are severe or interfere 
significantly with daily functioning, medication may be 
prescribed. Antidepressants, mood stabilizers, or hormonal 
therapies can help regulate neurotransmitters and 
hormones, alleviating mood swing symptoms. 
In the treatment of female mood swings, Unani medicine 
places a strong emphasis on dietary modifications, with a 
focus on the balance of hot and cold foods to maintain the 
equilibrium of humors in the body. Herbal remedies play a 
significant role in Unani treatments, with specific herbs like 
saffron, rosemary, and fennel being used to address mood 
imbalances and promote emotional well-being. Lifestyle 
modifications such as stress management techniques, regular 
exercise, and adequate rest are also recommended to 
support overall health and well-being. Additionally, 
rejuvenation therapies like massage, cupping, and 
detoxification are utilized in Unani medicine to cleanse the 
body of toxins and rejuvenate the organs. Psychological 
interventions such as counseling, mindfulness practices, and 
relaxation techniques are also employed to address the 
emotional aspects of mood swings and promote mental 
clarity and stability. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 
When comparing Unani medicine with modern medical 
approaches to treating female mood swings, it is evident that 
Unani medicine takes a more holistic and integrated 
approach to health and well-being. While modern medicine 
often focuses on symptom management through 
medications, Unani medicine seeks to address the underlying 
causes of mood swings and restore balance to the entire 
body. Both systems have their strengths and limitations, with 
modern medicine offering quick relief but sometimes 
accompanied by side effects, while Unani medicine provides 
a more gradual but sustainable approach to healing. 

Conclusion 
In conclusion, understanding the causes, symptoms, and 

treatment of female mood swings in Unani medicine sheds 

light on the importance of holistic approaches to women's 

health. By acknowledging the interconnectedness of the 

body, mind, and spirit, Unani medicine offers valuable 

insights into addressing mood imbalances and promoting 

emotional well-being in women. Moving forward, further 

research and collaboration between traditional and modern 

medical systems can help improve the quality of care for 

women experiencing mood swings and other health 

challenges.  

 

 



 

Female mood swings are a common and often challenging 

experience that many women face at different stages of their 

lives. Understanding the causes and symptoms of mood 

swings is essential for effective management and treatment. 

By implementing lifestyle changes, seeking therapy, and 

considering medication when necessary, women can address 

their mood swings and improve their quality of life. It is 

crucial to recognize the importance of mental health and 

seek help when needed to navigate the complexities of 

female mood swings successfully. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


